
The Andhra Pradesh Education (Amendment) Act, 1987

Act 27 of 1987

Keyword(s):
High School, Middle School, Registered Teacher,Secondary Education, 
Secondary School, Text Book

Amendment appended: 17 of 1993

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.



THE AHDHRA l«AJ>ESU EDUCATION' C&IBnLlQST?) ACT,
1937»

ACT No. 27 0.? .15.87,=■

L2?-i:h April, 1937 ,j

An Act further to 3mend v.’ne ixidhra Pradesh II iucr.- 

tion Act, 1982.

Be it enacted by the T/<i->i&lafclv5 Assembly of

the State of Andhta Pradesh iu tisj Thirty ei«huh

Year of the Republic of Indli as follows

1 This Act may ba called the Andhra siiori :

Pra ucation (Amendment), AcL, 1987< andean

r c r .L .

♦ J l e ce i v o d  t h e  a s s e n t  o f  t h e  " o v o r n o r  c.n U 3 29 t h  A p r i l ;  
1987 . F o r  S t a t e m e n t  o f  O b j e c t s  a nd  S e a s o n : . ,  p l i j s j  z-rs 

Andhr a  P r a d e s h  G a z e t c c ,  P a r t  I V-Ai  n a r y ,  d:\C£-i i ' i a
1s t  A p r i l ,  1087 a t  p a g e  17 ,

Ulc
.' .c.nc;-

[2 3 3  7



234

Amendment 
of rcction 2* 
Act I of- *  
1932.

(2) It shall come into force on such date .thu 
estate Government may, by notification, appoint.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Education Act, 1982,J 
(hereinafter referred to as the print)pal Act) in 
section 2,—

(i) in. clause (6 ), for the words “primary educa­
tion” the wordi> “pre-primary or primary educatirn” 
shall be substituted;

(ii) in clause (1 1 ), for the words “a college 
established or maintained'’ the words “a collegc 
including a medical college established or maintained” 
shall be and shall be deemed always to have been 
substituted;

(iii) in clause (16), for the words “general 
education”, the words “general education, medical 
education” shall be and shall be deemed always to have 
been substituted;

(iv) in clause (17),—

(1) in sub-clause (a) for the words “any person 
who, or body of persons which”, the words “any body 
o f persons which” shall be substituted;

(2) in $”b-clause (b), ft" the words “any 
person or body cf persons”, the words ‘‘any body of 
persons ” shall be substituted;

(v) in clause (1 8 ), for the wcrds “college” the 
ivordSj ‘’colleges including a medical college” shall be 
and shall be deemed always to  have been substituted;



(vi) for clause (19), the following clause shall be 
and shall be deemed always to have been substituted, 
namely:—

“(19) ‘general education’ means every branch 
of education, including special education, but does not 
.include medical education or .technical education

(vii) in clause (26), for the words “Zilla Parishad, 
Panvhayat Samithi” the words ‘'Zilla Praja Parishad, 
Mandala Praja Parishad” shall be substituted;

(viii) after clause (3 2 ), the following clause shall 
bs inserted, namely:—

“(32-a) “pre-primary education” means any 
education imparted prioi1 to primary education and 
includes education imparted in nursery, Kindergarten, 
montessory, angamvadi, balwadi and the like.;”

(ix ) in clause (3 5 ). Lhe words “person or” 
shall be omitted;

(x )  for clau.se (3 7 ), the following clause shall 
be substituted, namely:—

“(37) ‘secondary e&icatioh’ means education 
from class-VIII to Class-X^’-

3. In  section 7 of the principal Act,—  Am<
of «

(i) in sub-section (2 ), in clause (a), for the words 
“two years”, the words “three years” shall be substitu­
ted;

(ii) in clause (b) of sub-section (4),—

(a) in sub-clause (v), for the words “work 
experience”, ihe words “socially useful productive work” 
shall be substituted;

235



Suslik tioa
Cf UiW 050
tlon  fc i 
ticn  3.

(b) a[fc.r sub-c-lavxo (vii), the .following dri&zo 
sl:all be inserted, namely: —

‘ (vrli) fee intrcuirjlio;.'. Di Intermediate
Courses;

('ip.) the teaching ?.-f re oral s.3'

4. For section 8 of ^ho Principal Act, the following 
.section shall, be substituted, aaixiolv:—

o. {a ) Every mnnicipa1 coivoraUon or municipal 
-’istEWisi mirn, council sba'i make pot y vision for 
cT'd: ĵi';‘by ’ccai' '■a‘'':pa tac- $vA c-i tac secondary
auihVrife. ‘ ' education sra^o in the area withiri ivs

jurisdiction ror ail children in the
prescribed age group ordinarily resident

therein and eh all undertake the
management-ox pre-primary, primary and secoudaiy 
education schools *.akcn over, by the Govern .jaJ 
entrusted to it.

(2) Eveiy Zilfo F /aia Parish ad shall establish, 
maintain or expand secondary, vocational and indust­
rial schools in the area w iiliia iis jurisdiction and shall 
undertake the man.agerp.ent of such schools taken 
over by the-Government and entrusted to  it and chall 
also be responsible to implement the objectives of 
secondary education.

(3) Every Mandala Praja Parish ad shall be 
responsible to establish and maintain pre-primary and 
primary schools in the area within its jurisdiction and 
shall undertake the management o f such Government



zed  taken over ruled -3rimr-'/y ;:r.a [jn.y 3i'y i 
as (teamed n e c ta r y .

(4) Evui'y Coi'ri'svr.uoa, ’vlu;v!r-is?a!
Council, Zilla Praja o»- l-J^odaia Praja Paa-
shad shall under tabs i.c r:uVe .n-ov\:s:ou ter, pnt.l 
improvement of, iu'oora:n'-jd.iii>''.i fo- scl'^ois 
peoples participation-”.

3. To scciion-l 1 of the principal Ac\, ib<j foHcvins; 
explanation snail be added, n=• ’r . e l v -

“Expknotion: - -For nurposc." o.c fi’i'v -swouoii "nd 
sec(ioa-14, the term “approved scfox>;'’ in dudes a iio;:- 
formal education centre/'.

6. In the- Principal A i n  ^cUc,'i--i9, iyi da-.is,' (c), A.x-'.-'kvrnt
. o f  5̂ l ,o n  19.

the words “person or d isil be ow;Uec!...

7. In the principal Act, fro section-20 the ioHcwii^y sub.titudou
, ; ,  , , , , • - o f 1lew £00-

secfjons shall b e  substituted, .namely:—  now r.?r e-x>
lion  20.

- Tiie competent authority shall. from inno
'■permission f o r <«■ to time, conduct a survey as to identify
educational fLi- ths educational needs of the _ locality 
tutioaa. under its jurisdiction, and notify in the

prescribed manner through the local 
news papers calling for applications 

from the educational agencies desirous of establishing 
educational institutions.

(2) In pursuance of the notification under sub­
section. (1), any educational agency including local 
authority or registered body of persons intending to—



(a) establish an institution imparting . educa­
tion,

(b) open higher classes in an .institution 
imparting primary education; or

(c) upgrade any su£h institution into a 
high school;

(d) open new courscs (certificate, diploma, 
degree, post-graduate degree courscs, e tc .). ■
may make an application! •within such period, in such 
manner and to such authority as may be. notified for 
the grant of permission therefor.

(3 )  Any educational asency applying for permis­
sion under sub-section (2) shall,—

(a) before the permission is granted, satisfy the 
authority concerned,—

(i) that there is need for providing educational 
facilities to the people ir the locality;

(ii) that there is adequate financial provision 
for continued and eSicient maintenance of the institu­
tion as prescribed by tJie competent authority';

(ill) that the institution is proposed to be 
located in sanitary and healthy surroundings;

(b) enclose to the application:—

(i) title deeds relating to me site for building, 
playground and garden proposed to be provided;

(ii) plans approved by the local authority 
concerned which- shall conform to the rules prescribed 
therefor; and

(iii) documents evidencing availability of the 
finances needed for constructing the proposed . build­
ings; and

238



239

(c)- within the period specified by the authority 
concerned in the order granting permission:—

(i) appoint teaching staff qualified according 
to the rules made by the Government in this behalf;

(ii) satisfy the other requirements laid down 
by this Act and the rules and orders made thereunder 
failing which it shall be competent for the said autho­
rity to cancel the permission.

(4 )  On and from the commencement, of the 
Andhra Pradesh Education (Amendment) Act, 1987 
no educational institution shall be established except 
in accordance with the provisions of this Act and any 
person who contravenes the provisions of this section 
or-..who after the permission granted to him under this 
section having been cancelled continues to run such 
institution shall be punished with simple imprisonment 
which shall not be less than six months but which may 
extend to three years and with fine which shall not be 
less than three thousand rupees but which may extend 
to fifty thousand rupees:

Provided further that the court convicting a 
person under this section shall also order the closure 
of the institution with respect to which the offence is 
committed.''

On and from the commencement of the 
Andhra Pradesh Education (Amend- 

taWish institution̂  ment) Act, 1987 no individual shall 
establish a private institution:

Provided that tliis section shall not have any effect 
on any private institution established by an individual 
and recognised by the competent authority prior to 
such commencement;!”.



JVi-rtion
o :‘

Amend :?ic nt 
of scviion 22.

Amendment 
of  s:ction 24.

/
C. /'(ter ;-icnoi.' ■?."/ ol ti;c princip.,1 Act, i/i,; 

i_!levring wcUcn shall !>j inserted', namely:—
/

. .• ,Z±-r?\ -1) > N o  :n.vH:uyeii imparling education and 
'ocatccl in ihis StCM-j. shall atfiliatc. its-?!'-' 

Om'y'S.x* m.i- to any University cucside (he Slate oi.' 
mJj tJ-L- sti-iv A ’ldifiv. Pradesh.

(2; Who:1/,’ey coiiU'uvenes the provisions of sub­
section (I; siuii be- [jur:!Jicd with simple imprisonmep.' 
for a tv’ini v;iiic!i shall not be less than six months but 
which may extend to three yeari or with fine wliicb 
>hail 11oL iv. bss than three thousand rupees bui 
which inc.) extend to fifty thousand rupees or with 
both,

9. In scction 22 of the* Principal Act, for sub­
notion (3;, the following siib-scetion shall be substi­
tuted namely:—-

“(3) Any person who in contravention of sub­
section (2) runs any such un-recognised institution 
shall be punished with simple imprisonment for a term 
which shall not be less than six. months but which may 
extend to Uiree years or with Jine which shall not be 
less than three thousand rupees but which may extend 
to .iifty thousand rupees or with both.”.

10. In section 24 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (1), after'the proviso, the 
following further proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided further that the constitution of the 
management under this sub-section shall apply to a 
minority educational institution, in so far as it is not 
repugnant to clause (1 ) of article 30 of the Constitu­
tion of India,”

240



I 241

>\  (ii) to clause (a) of suo-section (3), the following 
farther proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided, further that no management of a 
minority educational institution shall be suspended 
under this sub-section- save for mismanagement.” ;

(iii) to sub-section (4), the following ■ proviso 
shall be added, namely:—

“Provided that no manager of a minority 
education&l institution- shall'be declared to be. so unfit 
under -this sub-section save for mis-managem,enr”

^iv) sub-scction (5 )  shall be omitted.
•'11. In section-26 of the Principal Act, in sub-sec- 

doa (2),- for the words “M e thousand rupees", th e0 
words ‘‘five thousand .<?/’, for the -words “two 
months” the words 'xr\£  year*’ and' for the words 
“rupees fifty ”, the words “rupees ons hundred” shall 
be substituted.

12. In section-27 o f the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “private
institution”, the words “private institution other than 
a'registered school” shall be substituted; !

( ii)  in sub-section ( 2 ) ,  in clause (b ), for the 
words “six months”, the words "one year” and for the 
words “two.thousand rupees” the words “five thousand 
rupees” shall .he substituted.

13. In section-28 o f the principal Act, m sub-section Araeidaeni
( 1 ) ,  for the words “private- institutions’ the words oi’soe},c®23- 
'*private institution other than a registered school”,
<ihan be substituted.

14. In section 32 of the principal Act,—
• or ssctfoo 32.

in sub-sec^n (6^,—

i (a) in the opening, paragraph, for the words,
■^with^fine -wjiich may extend to : two hundred and



iwrllon
Of p;w
’Clmpicr-
' / I-A,

fifty rupees” the words “with imprisonment for a term 
which shall not be less than six months but which may 
extend to one year or with fine which may extend- to 
one thousand rupees or with both” shall be substi­
tuted;

(b) in the proviso, tor the words “which may 
extend to three months or .vith a fine which .may extend 
to five hundred rupees or with both”, the words 
“which shall not be less than one year but which may 
extend to two years or with fine which may extend tb 
five thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted;

(c) after the proviso, the following further 
proviso shsijLHae added, namely:—

“PFoyided further that the Court convicting1 a 
person under this section shall also order the closure 
of the tutorial institution with respect to which the 
offence is comm itted”.

15. A.fter Chapter-VI of the principal Act, die 
following Chapter shall be inserted, namely:—*

CHAPTER-VI-A  

Registered Schools,

33-A...............................For She purposes of this
'Definition. Chapter, the expression “registered 

school”, shall mean a school recognised 
under section-21 but not receiving aid from the Govern­
ment.

242



243

33-B. ( 0  The competent authority slial), from time 
t0 conduct a survey as to identify ths 

BiVsgkiefcd need for establishing registered schoob  
under its jurisdictioa and then" no& y 

in the prescribed manner through the local news 
p:<--ers calling for applications from the educational 
.’“cj’.cies desirous of establishing the school to be 
«gistcred in the manner hereinafter 'provided.

(2) In pursuance of the notification under sub­
section (1 ) ,  any registered body of persons intending 
to,—

(a) establish a registered school;

(b) open higher classes in a registered 
cchooi imparting pre-primary or primary education; or

(c )  upgrade any such school into a high
eshesl

may make an. application, within such period, 
in such manner and to such authority as may be 
aotmed for the grant of permission therefor.

(3 )  The authority empowered to grant permis­
sion under sub-section (2 )  may, after satisfying that 
the conditions prescribed for the grant of permission 
ere fulfilled, grant the permission and register the 
school in such manner as may be prescribed or refuse 
such permission after giving reasons therefor and 
where the school is so registered a certificate to that 
efi&c’t may be issued in the name of the school.

33-C. (1) The management of every private institu- 
Spiciai . tien existing on the date of commence-

ment of the Andhra Pradesh Education 
(Amendment) Act, 1987 desirous of 

5 80 ' registering the school in accordance
with, the provisions of this Chapter may make an 
application for registration in accordance with-the 
provisions of section 33-B to the competent authority



244

within sixty days from such commencement s ami ‘ ii 
no application is made ’ within the said period ; or 
where the application is rejected, th e  institution . shall 
continue to be a .private1 institution.-

33-D. Where the competent authority' is ‘of the- 
cauxm m  opinion, that the-management of a fegis-
•M F K *  tered school, has failed to fu lfill.all. or
scSobrod any conditions of registration

under section 33-B or the rules made 
thereunder,, it  may after giving a ^notice not less than 
thirty days to the manager of such school Cancel the 
registration o f the school and the- certificate granted 
uiiiier section-33-B.

33-E. The teaching and non-teaching staff of the 
registered schools shall be entitled to

staff.
fb d  ive such salaries and allowances and shail be 
subject to such conditions o f service as may be pres- 
cripedi

.33-F The registered school shall follow the -same 
syllabi, text t books and luiud -books 

and follow- and maintain the .same records and
syllabus, etc. registers .as niay be followed and
maintained by the recognised schools.

/13-G. Tlie management of- every registered- school 
Advttory shall constitute an advisory body for

the pra-priinary, primary and upper 
primary classes and for secondary, school classes' sepa­
rately and the composition- and'' the constitution of 
such advisory body shall be s»uch- as may be prescribed.

33-H. The advisory body Sh&U perform- the follow- 
t t S S j  “ 8 functions, namelyf—
body.

(i) to advise the management in,.evoly^ng the fee 
structure;



245

( ii)  to evolve ihe procedure for the admission „
X  ihe students;

(iii) lo evolve the procedure for accounting 
and auditing the accounts of the registered school;

(ivj lo suggest guidelines for the administration 
ol the school without inicrfeiiug . with the minority 
character of the minority institutions;

(v ) lo approve liie annual report;
(vi) to_subject to the provisions of section-3 3-1: 

ev^ive Ihe procedure ter the recruitment and condi­
tions of service of the teaching and non-teaching stall 
of the registered school.

,*3-1, ISo registered school shall be entitled to 
<jE4au rceeive grant-in-aid or any other

"inranciai assistance from the Government lor its 
management. The existing recognised schools which 
are receiving the grant-in-aid shall continue to receivc 
such aid only until,' they are registered tinder 
scction

Ss-lr. i ue properties of any private institution ;
Properfc registered us registered school, like j

building, furniture, library, laboratory, j

equipment, playground, aids, endow­
ments and bank balances, shall -continue to be the 
properties of such, institution even after it is registered 
under seetioiv33'B. i

„ ,33.rK. (1) 1 transfer certificate in respect ol any 
wiitSttt© student of a registered school shall be
baeoantjr- in such form and issued in such manner
sijjnod * as may i-jg prescribed-

(2)'i Students of-any recognised school may 
^tkaission in or transfer from any such school to 

any registered school and vice-versa. The transfer

I



246

Amaidmant 
c f  sx tto a  
SS.

ce. tificate issued by the registered school shall be 
countersigned by the competent authority in such
iHLtoiicr as may be prescribed.

o.3-L. Where the Government have prescribed any 
forib~DiltI0!' common examination or any public 
students or examination for student evaluation, the 
registered students studying in the registered
icaooi. , i , ,, * o ^

schools shall appear tor those exami­
nations subject to satisfying the rules made in this 
behalf and the conditions prescribed by the Commis­
sioner for Government Examinations.

- 33-Mu Where the competent authority selects any 
iQfitcrS'j registered school as a centre for the
mako1*t0 conduct of the V ll Class, District Com-
arraogcniints m0n Examination, or the X  Class Public

uct’ ■ Examination, the management of i&3 
examination. school shall extend all tile facilities for
the smooth conduct of the examination.

It shall be the responsibility of the manage- 
Duties or the ment of a registered school to submitmanQecmsnt , . - .
ofiiio every year before such date aan to.

such authority as may be prescribed an 
annual report relating to the aduiinis- 

Liation of the school and such other information and 
statistical data as may be prescribed.

£ 3 -0 . The Government shall have the right to 
inspection. visit or cause an inspection to be made? 
by such person or persons as they may direct for a 
specified purpose of the registered school and also to 
;ause an enquiry to be made into the matters con­
nected therewith.”.

16. In section 56 of the prinicpal Act, in sub­
jection ( 3 ) ,  for the words “six months”, the words 
“one year” shall be substituted.



In ssction-V? of fhe Pricci^^T Act, to .(^ *1  ac
■;*ctiou (1) ,  the following provisos shall be a-1' section'9. 
namely:—

“Provided that no order of dismissal, removal 
or redaction m ranlc shall be passed under this sub' 
seclioa sgairst aa employee otiier than an employee 
of a minority educational institution without Uie 
ssior approval of such authority or Ofiicer ;.-s may 
bs prescribed for different classes of private insutu- 
tioas*'- ^ j

1 Provided further that the masjageinent rcô y prefer 
a i app-'al against any ordsr of the O.ffiosr or autho­
rity refusing approval under ihis sub-section to such 
aiuiiority ol' oScer and within such period as inuy be 
prescribed.”.

IS. In dtapisr-XIV of tiie principal Act, after ln-cnion of
«ectioa-84> the- following section shall be inserted ^ wctlQU
namely;—

- 0 3 4 - A .  i f  tite msjisgamSat or manager cc.utravens,
pcnaiiife foi-. ^tem pts to contravene, anv of the

coctravcu- * . r • , , ■ ,tiiiofjbis provisions of this chapter or any rule
<t~-,Kr- c>r order made thereunder, it or he shall

iic jmoislied with imprisonment for
a terra which :cay sxtecd to one year and with fine
vli'ch ra&y txtenn to five thousand rupees and in the
case of xcatimiing contravention, with imprisonment
£or a term wLich may extend to tv:o yeavs and with
fipe which may ssrteaa to Lea thousand rupees, in
addition to withdrawal of recognition of die insti-
iB ifO R .’1.

t9 . In section 35 of ths £*mc!pal Act, in sob- 
section (2) ,  the words “meonsultadon with repie- cfMĉ c-'<’ 
scntacives of the smployras of Educational insfi- 
tm’iiMis”’ snaif h i  cEitited.



y

rfsotiio^87. 20. In section 87 of the principal Act,—
)

( i)  in sub-section ( 1) ,  for the v.-ords “five 
hundred rupees” the words “one thousand rupees” and 
for the words “one hundred rupees”, the, words .“two 
hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii)  in sub-section ( 2 ) ,  for the w o r d i“one 
thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees” 
shall be substituted.

Aasodment 21. In section-96 of the principal Act, for the
o f section 96

words “two hundred and fifty rupees”, the words “one 
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

 ̂ - ut 22. In section 99 of the principal Act, in sub-
efeacdca 99.section ( 1 ) ,  in clause (fc>), item ( i)  shall be omitted.

248



THE ANDHRA PRADESH EDUCATION (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 1993.

*aCt no. 17 op 1993.

[29th September, 1993] 

VuAct further to amend the Andhra Pradesh Education Act, 1982.

BE it enae'ed by she Legislative Assembly of the Stale o f Andhra 
Pradesh in the Forty-fourth Year o f  the Republic o f India as follows:—

1. Sifizrt title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called th. 
Ajiklhr:’ I'radesh Education ( Amendment) Act, 1993.

(2) I r shall be deemed to have come into force with effect on and 
from the 13th July, 1993.

2. insertion o f new sections 78A and 78B.—Tn the Andhfa Pradesh
Education Act, o f  i9S2, in Chapter XIII, after section 
78, the following sections shall be inserted, namely:- 1

78A. "Age o f Superannuation o f the staff in aided private educationa 
institutions.—(1) Every teacher or member o f the non-teaching staff 
employed in any aided, private educationalinstitution, not belonging to 
last grade service, shall retire from service on the afternoon o f the last 
day o f the month in which he attains the age of fifty eight years :

Provided thct a teacher or a member o f  the non-teachirig staff afore­
said, who has already attained the age o f fifty-eight years and continuing 
in service on the date o f commencement o f the Andhra Pradesh Educa­
tion (Am endm ent) Act, 1993, sh?ll retire on the afternoon of the last 
day o f the month of the commencement o f the said Act.

‘Rcccived lhe asssui of the Governor on the 27ih September, 1393. For statement 
of Objccts and Reasons. PIsasc i d  tiie Andiira Pradesh Gazette, Part-IV-A, Extra­
ordinary, dated the 12th August, 1993 at Pages. 4 <£5.

91



92

(2) Evc.'v member belonging to the last grade service shall retire 
from service on the af cmooa o f Uie last day o f ‘.ho month in which he 
attains the age o f sixty years.

Explanation:—  For the removal o f doubts, it is hereby declared that 
n smployee whose date of birth is the first day o f  a month shall retire 
tom  service on the afc^raDon of the Ust day o f  the preceding month on 
attaining th i  age o f fifty sight or sixty years, as the case may b-j.

7813. Pension to the employees o f  aided private Junior and Degree 
College's.— (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any orders issued 
by the Government foi the payment o f pension to the employees o f the 
aided, private Junior and Degree Colleges before the commencement of 
the Andhra Pradesh Education ( Amendment) Act, 1993, such employees 
including those in the last grade service who attained the age o f  
superannuation as specified in section 7SA shall be entitled to pension 
with effect from 1st November, 1992 in accordance with such separate 
tules as may be made in that behalf.

(2) A teacher or a member in any aided private Junior and Degree 
Colleges who continues in service beyond the age o f fifty eight years for 
any reason shall be entitled to pension with effect from 1st November, 
1992 in accordance with such separate rules as may be made in that 
behalf” .

3. Act to override other laws.— The provisions o f this Act shall have 
i"fleet notwithstanding anything inconsistent therewith contained in any 
other law fur The time being in. force.

4. Repeal o f Ordinance 2 o f  1993.—Ths Andhra Pradesh Education 
^Amendment) Ordinance 1993 is hereby repealed.


