The Andhra Pradesh Education (Amendment) Act, 1987

Act 27 0f 1987

Keyword(s):
High School, Middle School, Registered Teacher,Secondary Education,
Secondary School, Text Book

Amendment appended: 17 of 1993

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




3
Lot

TPE ADIRE TRADESH IDUCATLION {(AIBITIEITT) &
1987,

ACT Wo. 27 OF 18567.%
12%¢h April, 1937.)

An Act further t¢ amend #he (ndhra Pradech Eliuce-
tion Act, 1982.

Be it enacted by the Fepisilative Assewmblr of
the State of Andhxa Pradesh ju tii2 Thizty eighch
Year of the Republic of indi: as follows:i-

) This 4ct may b2 called the Andhra spere tile
Pra ucation (Agendment) Act, 1987. aud comacnce-
' rend,

*Received the assent of the Sovernor on iha 28k Aoril,
1887. For Statement of Objects and Reasoni, ploss? 208 (he
Andhra Pradesh Gazet<c, Part IV=A. Zxiraorcinary, daca: tha
1st April, 1987 at page 17, ‘



Amendnical
of tootion 2}

Act ! of
1982,

234
(2} It shali come ito force on such date 23 .the
State Gevernment may, by notification, appoint.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Education Act, 1982/
(hereinaiter referred to as the principal Act) in
section 2,— '

(i} in clause (6), for the words “primary educa-
tion” the words “pre-primary or primary educaticn”
shall ;e substituted;

(if) in clause (11), for the words “a college
estublished or maintained” the words “a college
including a medical college established or maintained”
shaii be and shall be deemed alwaj!s to have been
substituted;

(i) in clause (1), for the words “general
education”, the words “general education, medical
education” shall be and shall be decmed always to have
been substituted; ' :

{iv) in clause (17),—

(1) in sub-clause (a) for ihe words “any person
who or body of persens which”, the words “any body
of perscns which® shall be substituted;-

{2) in snb—cléuse {b), f» the words “any
patson ¢r body cf perscns”, the words “any body of
persons ” shall be substituted;

{v) in clause (18), for t:‘e weceds “college” the
words, “celleges including a medical college” shall be
and shal! be deemed aiways to have been substituied;



235

vi) for clause (19), the folowing clause shall be
and sLall be deemed always to have been substituted,
namely:—

“(19) ‘general education’ means every branch
of education, including special education, but doss not
inzlude medical education or .technical educationg’;

(vii) in clause (26), for the words “Zilla Parishad,
Panchayat Samithi” the words “Zilla Praja Parishad,
Mauandala Praja Parishad” shall be subsfituted;

(viii) after clause (32), the following clause shall
bs inserted, namely:—

*(32-2) “pre-primary education” means any
education imparted prior to primary education «nd
includes education imparted in nurséry, Kindergarten,
nwoptessory, anganwadi, balwadi and the like;”

(ix) in clause (35!), the werds “person or”
shall be cmitied; :

(x) for clavse (37), the folicwing clause shall
be substituted, nameiy —

“31H qeconuary mﬁ‘._cahon means education
fron, class-VIII to Class-X2.

3. In section 7 of the principal Act,— Am

of s¢

(i) in suh-section (2), in clause (a), for the words
“two years”, the words “three years” shall be substitu-
ted; ’

(ii) in-clause (b) of sub-section (4),—
(2) in sub-clause (v), for the words “work

experience”, the words “socmLy useful productive work”
-shall be substituted;



238

() afeer sub-cianss (vil), the folioving elrviess
seall be imisrted, npomely: -- -

o

“(vig) the indrcduclion of  Intermediage

£ e .
Courses;

(r) the leaching of morais.”

St o 4. Tor cection. 8 of {fic Trincipal ict, the foliowing

oalivee» gaction shall be substituted, mamelyi-—

6. {1) Bvery rarcaicipal corporation or murnicinal

sEsebhsi fuw,  couneil aball make provision for eda-

el erbaals 5 eea) 2HOD unio fhe sud of the  secordary

authoritics. <ducaiion stace in the area within i

©jurséietion for  ail  chiidren im  the

prescrived age growp oxdinarily resident

therein  and  ghall  undertoke i

mepagement of pre-primaary, vrimary and  secoudery

educaiicn schaols 2aken over bty the Governmes: «nd
eniriusied io i,

{(€) Buery Zilla Fyoja  Parishad shall  establish,
maintain or e¢xpand secondary, vocational and in-ust-
riz{ schools in (he area wiilda i3 jmisdiction and shall
undertake the meanagement of such  schools taken
over by the-Government and entrusied to it and chall
also be responsible (o implement the objectives of
secondary education. ‘

(3) Every Maadala Praja Parishad shall be
responsible fo establish and maintain pre-primary aud
primary schools in ihe area within its jurisdiction aad
shall undertake the management of such  Govermngit



257

and tzken over ahied b-'e-!_rimr't}' end proracy shosls
as deemed necestar

o

(%) Yiwery fassive. Covearsiton,  Adupicipal
Oouneidl, Zille Praye Focsine ov Riandaia Fraga Pate

chied shall underinke v mue owovsion  for, end
improvement of, accorunadiiiva fv. sainiols with
peopies pariicipation.”.

5. To seuiion-11 0f the poincipal A, s following daendoeat
cxnlanation .shall be addeq, maaly-—

“Explinotion:-~For purposes of i seddoz and
seetion-14, the tetra “aponroved sciow)” includes & i
formal educalien ceatrs,”,

6. In the Pn_mpﬂ.l A, _:1 eoticn-LG) i clanss (€3, A?Tbok?sl)
. Of 3eei ot N
the wordy “person or” chsll be ompitied.

7. In the principal Act, no section-20 tie jollowing S?b.’titu'.ion
. B O 1ICWY SCC-
sections shall be sebstitnied, namely.— tiony {W,o,
tion 29,

2. (%) The compseient authority shall, from tunc
- permission for e (G 1ime, conduct a survey as to identify

tblshment of - the educational needs of the locality

tutions. under its jurisdiction, and nolify in the
preseribed manner through the locul
news papers calling for applications
from the educational agencies desirous of establishing
educational institntions,

(2) In pursuance of the notification under sub-
section. (1), any educational agency including locui
auttority or registered body of persons intending to—



238

(a) establish an institution imparting . educa-
tion, } . ' :

(b) open higher classes in an imstitution
imparting primary education; or

{c) upgrade amy such- imstitution into a
high schooi; '

(d) open new courscs (certificate, diploma,
degree, post-graduate degree courscs, ¢ic.), - ~

may meke an application, within such period, i such
mmapner and to such authority as may bs notified for
the zrant of permission thercfor,

(3} Any educational agency applying for permis-
ston under sub-section (2) shail,—

(a) before the permission is granted, satisfy the
authority concerned,—

(i) that there is necd for providing educationai
facilities to the pecple in the losality;

(i) that therc is adeguate finzucial provision
for continued and eflicicnt mainienance of the imstitu.
tion as prescribed Dy the competent authority:

(i) that ike imstitviion is ovroposed to be
located in sani‘ary and healtly surroundings;

(b} enclose to the application:—

(i) title deeds relating to tue site for building,
playground and garden proposed to be provided;

(i) plans acproved by tae local authority
concerned which- shall con.torm to the rules prescribed
therefor; and

(lii) documents evidencing availability of the
fnances needed for comstructing the proposed . build-
ings; and



238

(c)- within the period specified by the authority
concerned in the order granting permissioni—

, (i) appoint teaching staff qualified according
to the rules made by the Government in this behalf;

(i) satisfy the other requirements laid down
by this Act-and the rules and orders made thereunder
failing which it shall be competent for the said autho-
rity to caice] the permission.

{4) On and f{rom the commencerent of the
Andbhra Pradesh Education (Amendment) Act, 1987
no educational institution shall be established except
in accordance with the provisions of this Act and any
person who contravenes the provisions of this section -
or-who after the permission granted {o him uwnder this
-section having been cancelled continves to run such
institution shall be punished with simple imprisonment
which shall nct be less than six months but swhich may
extend to three years and with fine which shall not be
less than three thousand rupees but which may extend
to fifty thousand rupeces:

Provided further that the cowmt convieting 2
person under this section shall also order the closure
of the institution with respect to which the offence i
committed.”

& 70-& Op and from the commencemest of the
Prohiesion of Andhra Pradesh Educatiocn (Amend-

individuals to vs- e,
tablish instiintions, ment) Act, 1987 no  individual shall

establish a private instituton:

Provided that this section shall not have any effect
on any private institution established by an  individual
and recognised by t‘he competent  authority prior to
such conunencements”,



Famartion
o Cow
soction
REETeN

Anepdient
of sevtion 22,

Amendmient
of sxction 24,

240

I

S, nfter coetior” %07 of toe principel Act, the
12 dewing section shali b insertcd, namely:-—

Al 4
et Ty Ne omghiden imparling edocation and
: focated to this Side shall alflinwe  iwsalt
5 to any University outside fhe Siate ot
shalestee o andhry Pradesh, '

(27 Whosver contravenes the provisions of sub-
section {1) shwil be punished vity simple imprisonmens
for a terra which shali not be less than six monihks bui
which muay extend o tuee ysars or with fing  which
shall noi e loss aan three  thousand rupecs bui
which inay 2xtend to fifly  thowsand  rupces or  with
both.

O In scetion 22 of the Pruwipad Act, for sub-
scetion (3), ihe following  sub-section shall te swosti-
luted gamelyi—-

“(3)- Any person who in contravention of sub-
s=clion (2) rums any such un-aecognised  institution
shall be punished with simple imprisonment for a term
wizich shall not be less thau six izonths but which may
extend to three years or with fine which shall not be
less than three thousand rupces but which may extend
to fifty thousand rupees or with both.”.

10. In section 24 of the priacipal Act,—

() in sub-section (1), after-the proviso, the
following further proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided further that the constitution of the
management under this sub-scction shall apply to =2
minarity educational institution, in so far as it is not
repiignant ta clause (1) of article 30 of the Constitu-
tion of India,”



| 241
4% (i#) to clause (a) of sub-section (3), the following
furthér proviso shall be added, namely:—

. “Provided further that no management of a
‘minority educational institution shall be suspended
undér this' sub-section® save for mismanagement.”;

: (iii) to sub—s&;tioﬁ (4), the following - proviso -
shall be added, namely:— ' ' _
“Provided that no manager of a minority’
educationél institution- shall' be declared to be\so unfit
uneer-this sub-section save for mis-management*”
{iv) sub-scction (5) shall bz omitted.

*'11. 1ln section-26" of the Principal Aci, in sub-scc-
fton" (2), for the words “oue thousand rupees”, the
words “five thousand :ui..os”, for the words “two
moaths™ the words “ome wear” and for the words
“rupecs fifty 7, the words “rupees ons hundred” shall
be substituted.

N » . = - L » - — .

: 12. _In_secuon 2’1- of thf: principal Act, Amd %
_ . (i) in sub-section (1), for the words “private
institution”, the words “private institution other than
a‘registered schoo ¥ shall be substituted; ’

" (i) in sub-section (2), in cluuse (b), for the
words “six months”, the words “one year” and for the
words “two.thousand rupees” the words “five thousand
runees” shall .be substituted.

13. In section-28 of the principal Act, in sub-section Amcidmot:
(1), for the words “private’ institutiony the wvrords o/™eHon 22
“private institution other than a registered school”,
shall be substituted,

14. In section” 32 of the principal Act,— A
in sub—sect_iq-n (6),-—;-_

; (a) in the opeping. paragraph,. for the words;
“avith .fine ..which may extend to'two hundred -and

Amcadmens
of sectioa 25,



(242

fitty rupees” the words “with imptisonment for a term
which shall not be less than six months but whick may
extend to one year or with fine which may extend to
~one thousand rupees or with both"” shall be subst-
tuted;

(b) in the proviso, tor the words “which may
extend to three months or with 2 fine which may extond
to five hundred rupees or with both”, the words
“which shall not be less than onz year but which may
extend to two years or with fine which may extend to
five thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted;

(c) after the proviso, the following further
proviso shall“be added, namely:—

“Pfovided further that the Court convicting a
person under this section shall also order the clesure
of the tntorial institution with respect to which the

3 Ay

offence is commitied.”.

irsertion 15. After Chapier-VI of the principai Act, the

of g2 .y . . M . -
Chager.  ¥Oowing Chapter shall be inserted, namelyse-

YTapy

CHAPTER-VI-A

Registered Schools,
33A. oo For the purposes of this
*Definition. Chapter, the gxpression  “registered

school”, shali mean a school recognised
nnder section-21 but not receiving aid from the Govern-
ment.



243

43-8, (1) The compstent authority shall, from time

P"Q'n_!' sien o vy . " -
ebbaan oy totime, conduct a survey as to identify the

of rrghdered acefl for establishing registered schools
RCO. under its jurisdiction and then” noWiy

m e prescrived maunner through the local news
vepers  calling for  applications from the educational
2gencics  desirous of  establishing  the scheol to be
registered in the manner hereinafter provided.

(2) In pursuance of the notification under sub-
secuon (1), any registered body of persons intending
Lo :
{a) establish a registered school;

~ .(b) open higher classes in a registered
echool imparting preprimary or primary education; or
(c) vpgrade any such school into a high
gcheol i
Ry make an application, within such period,
in such manner and to such authority as may be
aotiied for the grant of permission therefor.

(3) The authority empowered to grant permis-
sion under sub-section (2) may, after satisfying that
the conditions prescribed for the grant of permission
ere tnlfilled, pgrant the permission and register the
school in such manner as may be prescribed or refuse
such permission after giving teasons therefor and
where the school is so registered a certificate to that
effact may be issued in the name of the school.

33.C. (1) The management of every private institu-

é{’jﬁi‘i‘ea " tien existing on the date of commence-
respect of ment of the Andhra Pradesh Education
5&3.558. . (Amendment) Act, 1987 desirous of

o registering the school in accordance
with the provisions of this Chapter may make an
application for registration in accordance with-the
provisions of section 33-B to the competent authority



244

within sixty days from - such - commiencement : ami i
no application is made ~ within the said penod “or
where the spplication is rejected, the institation. shall
continue to be a,pnvate institution..

33-D. Where the competent authorify” is"of the

o reon opinion that the management of ‘a regis- -
‘tion of the tered school -has failed to fulfill all.or
Seared any of the conditions of registration

under section 33-B or the rules made:
thereunder, it may after giving a ‘notice not Jess than
thirty days to the ‘manager of such. school dancel the
registration of the school and the- ccrtificate granted
unaer seclion-33-B.

33-E, The teaching and non-teaching staff of the
:%“;;,‘Tm“‘o, registered schools shall be entitled to
9
fective such salaries and -~ allowances and shall be
subject to such conditions of semcc as may be pres-

criped.

B34 The registered school shall follow the.-same
%&m syllabi, text books and hand * -books
and follow and maintain thé¢ .samé records and

e cic. registers as iy be [ollowed and
mavtaied by the recognised schools.

433G, The management of every -rcgis‘Lered-'school

. dvisory shail ~constitute 'an advisory body for
the pre-priinacy, primary and -upper

primnary ciasses and for sec,ondary school "classes sepa-
rately and the composition. and" the constitlition of
such advisory body shall be such: as may be preScrlbed

33H The advnsory hody shall perforny the ‘follow-
s ing functions, namelyi—
body.
(i) to advise the management in evo“ixx,ug the fee
structure;



245

(it} to evolve the procedure for the admission
vi the students;

(iii) 1o evolvc the procedure for accounting
and auditing the accounls of the registered school,

(iv) to suggest guidelines for the adminisiration
of the schovl withdut inicrfeiing = with the minority
character of the minority institutions;

(v) lo appiove lhe annual report;

(vi) ubject to the provisions of section-33-kE
evolve the procedure for the  recruitment and condi-
tions of service of the teaching and mon-teaching staff
of the registered school.

.33-1, No registesed  school shail be entitled to
Greats rceeive  grant-in-ald  or any other
‘Sirencial  ussistance  Iromy the Government for its
management. The existing recognised schools which
are receiving the grant-in-aid shall continue to receive
such aid oply untill they are segistered under
section 33-B. ‘

3:-F pue properties ol any privale  insttlution

“Pruposties registered us  registered  school, Lke
vl icafsterey building, furnilure, library, laboratory,

cquipment, playground, aids, endow-
meals and bank balances, shall continue to be the
propeities of such iostitution even after it is registered
under section-33-B.

»

x._ (1) ‘Ihe transfer certificate in respect ol any

It student of a registered school shall be
be counter- in such form and isswed in such mannecr
signed * as may be prescribed.

(2):8tudénts 6% any recognised school may
szek sdraission in or transfer from any such school to
any registered school and vice-versa. The transfer



246

ceilificate issued by the registered school shall be
countersigned by the competent authority iz such
muzauer as may be prescribed,

33-L. Where the Government have prescribed aay

f?r::.?'mmwu common examination or any . plibliC
stugeats of examination for student evaluation, the
registered students studying in the registered

scheols shall appear for these exami-
nations subject to satisfying the rules made in this
behall and the conditions prescribed by the Commis-
sioner for Government Exaninations.

- 33-M. Where the competent authority selects any

Kﬁb’sgr&! . registered school as &4 centre for the
ke conduct of the VH Class, Districi Com-
arraggenments mon Examination, or the X Class Public
for conduct- . P .

ing of - Examination, the mavagement of e
examination. school shall extend all the tacilities for

the smooth conduct of the examination,

3N It shall be the responsibility of the manage-

Atics of ihe ment of a registered school to submit
of the every year beforc such date arg (o
fegistered such authority as may be prescdbed an

annual report relating to the admiais-
eaavn of the school and such otker information aud
statistical data as may be prescribed.

33-0. The Geovermment shall have the right to
Inspection. visit or cause an inspection to be made
by such person or persons as they may direct for &
specified purpose of the registered school and alse t¢
cavse an enquiry to be made into the mattets coB-
nected - therewith.”.

. 16. In seciion 56 of the prinicpal Act, in sub-
ofxtion cection (3), for the words “six: months”, the words
“one year” shall be substituted.



=47
78 In section'I? of ihe  Princiyai” Act, o ieaa a;
siction (1), the following provisos shall be o etter™.
pamely;—

“Providod thet no order of dismissal, remaval
ot reduction in rank shall be passed uader this <ub.
seslion a2gainst an employee other than sn employze
of a wincrity educational instituticn without ithe
wijor approval of such authority or Officer 5 may
be -prescribed for different classes of private insiitu-
ticas: . I
. :
“Provided further that the mavagement nay prefec
an apjpal ageiest any onder of the Gificer or autho-
ricy refusing approval under his sub-section fo such
awhiority or oficer and within such period as may be
prescribed.”,
13. In chapior-Y[IV of the principal Act, after fn-crion of |
ceciion-84, the following section shall be inserted §ry e
neraelyi—

- 844, X the mansgewalint or manager contravens,

Densities for or atfempis to conttavese, any of the
tan of this provisions of this chapler or any rule
Banis : or order made thereunder, it or he shall

pe  pooished with  imprisonment for
& term which sy oxtend to onc year and with fiae.
wh'ch ragy catenn to five thoussnd rapees zand in the
case of contimung contravention, with fmprisonment
for s tom wiich may extend io tvio  years and with
fine which may eitend to w2n  thousandt  rupecs, in
adoltion to  withdrawal of recognition of the iusti-
vtion.”,

10. In soction 35 of the guindgal Acl, iR Sub~ ypetrm
section (2), the words “inconsultation with  repre- afsoctizg B3,
sontatives of the amgloyess of Educatfonat insti-
tutiens”, sball e amiitsd.



'248
Apendmes! 20, In section 87 of the pri’ncipal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “five
hundred rupess” the words “one thousand rupees” and
for the words “one hundred rupees”, the. words “two
hundred rupees™” shall be substituted;

(if) in sub-section (2), for the words . ‘one
thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupses” A

shall be substituted,
Amndment 21. In section-96 of the principal Act, for the
of section 96.

words “two hundred and fifty rupees”, the words “ons
thousand rupees” shall be subatituted.

_ 22. In seciion 99 of the pringipal -Act, in sub-
Aseadmont - , . . ) \
efesetion 99.section (1), in clauge (b)), item (i) shall be cmitted.



THE ANDHRA PRADESH EDUCATION (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 1993.

*sCT NO. 17 or 1993,
[29¢it Septembrer, 1993]

vuAct further io amend the Andhra Pradesh Education Act, 1982,

BE it cnacied by ihe Legislative Asscmbly of the Staie of Andhra
Pradesh iv the Forty-fourth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called th.
Andhry 'redesh Education ( Amendment)} Act, 1993.

(2) Itshall be deemed to have come into force with effect on and
from the 13th Jely, 1993,

2. insertion of new sections 784 and 78B.—In the Andhra Pradesh
Education Act, of 1982, im Chapter XIil, after section
78, the following seciions shall be insericd, namely :- )¢

18A. *Adge of Superannuation of the staff in aided private educationa
institutions.—(1) - Bvery tcacher or member of the non-teaching staff
employed in anyaided, private educationalinstitution, not belonging to
last grade service, shall retire from service on the afternoon of the last
day of the month in which he attains the age of fifty eight years :

Provided that a teucher or 8 member of the non-teaching staff afore-
said, who has already attained the age of fifty-eight vears and continuing
in setvice on the date of commencement of thé Andhra Pradesh Educa-
tion ( Amendment) Act, 1993, shzil retire on the aftcrnoon of the last
day of the month of the commencement of the said Act.

*Received the assznt of the Governor on the 27th September, 1993. For statement
of Objects and Reasons, Plaase scé the Andira Pradesh Gazetre, Part-fV-A, Exira-
‘ordinary, dated the 12th August, 1993 at PaSes. 4 &£35.

91



92

(2} Evecv member belonging to the last grade service shall retire
from service on the af croon of the last day of the monsih in which he
attzins the age of sixty years.

Explanation.— For the removal of doubts, it is horeby declared that

n zmployee whoss date of birth is the first day of a month shall retire
rom service on ike afczraoon of the last day of the preceding moath on
attaining thz age of fifty sight or sixiy years, as the case may be.

H
)

78B. Pension to the employees of aided private Jumior and Degree
Colleges.—{1) MNotwithstunding anything contained in any orders issusd
by the Government for the payment of pension  to the employces of the
aided, private Juaior and Degeee Calleges before the commensement of
the Andhra Pradesh Education ( Amendment ) Act, 1993, such cumployces
including those in the last grade scrvic: who attained the age of
supzrannuation as spzcifizd in section 78A shall be cntitled to pension
with effect from Ist November, 1992 in accordance with such separate
rules as may bz made in that bzhalf

(2) A teacher or 2 member in any aid=d private Junior and Degree
Collcges who continucs in service boyond the age of fifty eight yeacs for
any reason Shall be entitled to pension with effect from Ist Novembser,
1992 in accordance with such separste rules as may be made in that
behalf .

3. Act to avervide other laws.—The provisions of this Actshall have
effect notwithstanding anything inconsistent therewith contained in any
other law for the time bring in force.

4.  Repeal of Ordinance 2 of 1993.—Thz Andhra Pradesh Educaflon
Amendment ) Ordinanc:, 1993 is hercby repezled.



