KA / BG - GPO/ 2515 /WFPP-47/ 2009 - 2011

w@% BN TFLIBSIWTW
Q3R xSF

790 - IV-A dotitedd, Bogwes, Sieste 2%, 20NN (HF ¥, B Jae NFRI) dJo. 239

EDUCATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
No. ED 43 TEC 2011, Bengalooru, Dated: 21-3-2011

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 14 of the Karnataka Education Institutions (Prohibition of
Capitation Fee) Act, 1984 (Karnataka Act 37 of 1984}, the Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following -
rules further to amend the Karnataka Selection of Candidates for Admission to Government seats in
Professional Educational Institutions Rules, 2006 namely:- - ‘

" 1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Selection of Candidates for
Admission to Government seats in Professional Educational Instltutlons (Second Amendment) Rules,. 2011.

(2) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the official Gazette.

2. Amendment of rule 3.- In the Karnataka Selection of Candidates for Admission to Government seats in
Professional Educational Institutions Rules, 2006 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules) in
rule 3,-

* (1} in sub-rule (1), in clause (b), in sub-clause (iii),- ‘
(i) the words “computer sc}ence” and the word “electronics” shall be omitted.
{ii) for the words “forty five percent” the words “fifty percent” shall be substituted.

(i) in the second pfoviso, for the words “forty percent”, the words “forty five percent” shall be
"~ substituted.

(* . . N
(2) in sub-rule (3), for the words “forty percent” and the words “forty-five percent” the words “ forty five
percent” and the words “fifty percent” shall respectively be substituted.

, 3. Amendment of rule 5.- In rule 5 of the said rules, in sub-rule (1),

(@ in clause (v), for the words and figures “one year from 1% July of the previous year to 30" June of
the year of admission”, the words and figures “one year service in Karnataka during the two year
period of Pre-University or 11" or 12" Standard course” shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (vi), after the words “Defense Unit", the words “of Army / Air force / Navy where the
parent’s service records are maintained” shall be inserted.

(iii) in clause (ix), for the words and figures “one year in Kamataka from 1* July of the previous year
to 30" June of the year of admission”, the words and figures “one year service in Karnataka during
the two year period of Pre-University or 11" or 12" Standard course” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of rule 17.- In rule 17 of the said rules, in sub-rule (1), for the words “Ten percent”, the
words “Twenty percent” shall be substituted.

By Order and in the name of the Governor of Karnataka

B.N. JAGADEESH
Under Secretary to-Government,
Education Department (Technical)

BEE0 S0PEo0D, ST FoP 3T, Jotiuech. (&3) (700 BaTD)




